
CITY OF FORT WAYNE 

BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING 

200 E BERRY STREET -  STE 210 ROOM 220 

FEBRUARY 1, 2024 

 Page 1   

Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Rupright, Nathan Baggett and Eric Steinman. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0829P, Rebid 2024 Tree removal                               (eBidDoc# 8919747) 

bid date/time: 2/1/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW -  N Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating LLC NO BID 

CTC Disaster Response, Inc. NO BID 

Phillips Tree Service LLC NO BID 

Summit Tree Care LLC $165,000.00  

Sunflower Lawn and Landscaping $65,775.00  

Wheatcraft Tree and Lawn Service $76,485.00 

Worx Companies $65,956.00  

  
ENGINEERS ESTIMATE: $86,694.00  

 

 

#67112, Adams Center & Tillman                                (eBidDoc# 8913308) 

bid date/time: 2/1/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – B Gensic 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Dunigan Bros., Inc. $5,344,440.48  

Fox Contractors $2,227,357.00  
Kokosing Industrial, Inc. - Westerville NO BID 

Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC NO BID 

Miller Pipeline Corp NO BID 

Murphy Pipeline Contractors $10,011,750.00 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $3,804,900.00  
VTF Excavation, LLC NO BID 

  

ENGINEERS ESTIMATE: $3,747,600.00  
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#75685, Adams Center Sanitary                                   (eBidDoc# 8913309) 

bid date/time: 2/1/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – N Baggett 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $5,914,725.00  
Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID 

Bunn Excavating, Inc $3,894,737.79  

Dunigan Bros., Inc. $4,703,424.87  
Fleming Excavating Inc NO BID 

Harlow Enterprises Inc NO BID 

Kokosing Industrial NO BID 

National Trench Safety Shoring NO BID 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. NO BID 

  
ENGINEERS ESTIMATE: $4,807,175.00  

 

 

#83926, Huffman Ph II -4th St                                      (eBidDoc# 8915515) 

bid date/time: 2/1/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – E Steinman 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $586,888.00  

Bunn Excavating, Inc $481,846.97  

Krafft Water $405,287.50  
Crawford Excavating NO BID 

Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. $498,400.00  

  
ENGINEERS ESTIMATE: $516,150.00  

 

**RFQ** 

#111-1-9-24-5, ROW On-call                                    (eBidDoc# 8917621) 

bid date/time: 1/25/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – N Jarrell 

NAME RFQ Rec’d 

Bercot Inc Rec’d 

Ceres Environmental Services, Inc.  
DRC Emergency Services Rec’d 

FW Trucking LLC Rec’d 

Kreager Group Inc. Rec’d 

Schenkel Construction Inc  
Wheatcraft Tree and Lawn Service Rec’d 

Worx Companies Rec’d 

  
 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:11 pm 


