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Present: Michelle Nelson, Greg Kreiger, Dan Shaw, Matt Gray, Brian Kiess, Phil Labrash and Patrick Zaharako. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0707D, Alley – Kinsmoor, Nuttman                        (eBidDoc# 8970708) 

bid date/time: 2/29/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Brian K 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating LLC $110,008.00  
Exterior Service $153,218.00  
Key Concrete, Inc. $142,725.00  
Malott Contracting, Inc. $136,332.50  
Shannon Concrete Construction $142,310.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $141,000.00  

 

 

#0727A, 2024 Resurfacing NE                                     (eBidDoc# 8972807) 

bid date/time: 2/29/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Bob W 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction Co Inc. $1,514,470.00  
E&B Paving Inc. $1,520,761.00  
Wayne asphalt $1,470,326.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,634,489.00  

 

 

#0729A, 2024 Resurfacing SW                                     (eBidDoc# 8974931) 

bid date/time: 2/29/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Greg K 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction Co Inc. $1,552,408.00  
E&B Paving Inc. $1,388,347.00  
Wayne asphalt $1,595,630.00  
  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,609,459.50  
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#0783C, Kyle Rd Neighborhood                                   (eBidDoc# 8970715) 

bid date/time: 2/29/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Brian K 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete Corp $943,710.00  
Key Concrete, Inc. $1,031,480.00  
Malott Contracting, Inc. $961,196.00  
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $970,370.00  

 

 

 

#12282, Covington Rd Trail – Hadley to Getz          (eBidDoc# 8970702) 

bid date/time: 2/29/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW –  Dawn R  & Dan S 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $2,283,514.00  
Brooks Construction Co Inc. NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Fleming Excavating Inc $1,938,246.36  
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID 

Pioneer Associates, Inc. NO BID 

Wayne asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,869,612.00  

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:11 pm 


