CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
MINUTES e JANUARY 26, 2023

Present: Michelle Nelson, Nick Jarrell and Michelle Peterson.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0711S, 2023 Barrett 50/50 (eBidDoc# 8366084)

bid date/time:

1/26/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Garcia Concrete $91,249.00

Key Concrete $91,157.00

Malott Contracting NO BID

Worx Companies NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $92,314.00

#0712S, ROW Misc. (eBidDoc# 8366083)

bid date/time:

1/26/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Garcia Concrete $91,605.00

Key Concrete $91,249.00

Engineer’s Estimate $92,296.00

#0713U, 2023 ADA Curb (eBidDoc# 8366038)

bid date/time:

1/26/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Garcia Concrete $76,210.00

Key Concrete $76,097.50

Engineer’s Estimate $77,116.00

#0714G, 2023 Curb (eBidDoctt 8366039)

bid date/time: 1/26/2023 2:00 PM
owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Garcia Concrete $46,080.00

Key Concrete $45,754.00

Malott Contracting $47,583.17

Engineer’s Estimate $46,571.00
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#0715S, 2023 Sidewalk Trip Haz
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8366042)
1/26/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

American Sidewalk Management NO BID

Garcia Concrete $45.50

Precision Concrete $34.83

Universal Concrete $19.13

We Fix Sidewalks $19.97

Engineer’s Estimate $33.00

#0717P, 2023 Tree Removal
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8366041)
1/26/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works - Nick Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Homer Tree Service NO BID

Sunflower Lawn and Landscaping $75,999.00

Worx Companies $75,135.06

Engineer’s Estimate $87,008.00

Adjourn Time: _2:13 pm
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