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Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz, Nathan Baggett, Emily Grabill and Shan 

Gunawardena. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

0391A, 2020 Resurfacing Pkg NE                                                                (eBidDoc #6874873) 

bid date/time: 1/28/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – James Reitz 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction NO BID 

Brooks Construction $1,155,364.00 

E&B Paving $966,822.50 

Wayne Asphalt $1,024,419.10 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $1,263,860.88 

 

 

0491C, Brookside Park Concrete                                                                  (eBidDoc #7362443) 

bid date/time: 1/28/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – James Reitz 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $1,140,065.30 

Hipskind Concrete $1,133,333.33 

Key Concrete $1,186,862.00 

Malott Contracting $1,184,464.00 

Primco Inc. NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $1,233,260.00 
 

 

83536, Airport Expressway & Ardmore Ave                                               (eBidDoc #7472551) 

bid date/time: 1/28/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Nathan Baggett 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bunn, Inc $734,500.00 

Crosby Excavating $709,536.10 

Fleming Excavating $681,228.18 

Fox Contractors  $849,424.00 

Heartland Restoration Services NO BID 

Ironclad Excavating NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $933,175.00 
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83711, Barr St Flood Gate & CSO 029 Gate Mods                                    (eBidDoc #7475927) 

bid date/time: 1/28/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Emily Grabill 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $274,944.00 

Haskins Underground NO BID 

Ottenweller Contracting $357,675.00 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $185,348.00 
 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _2 :07 pm 
 


