CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

JANUARY 4, 2024

Present: Michelle Nelson, Shan Gunawardena, Michelle Rupright, Phil Labrash and Brad Lewis.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0035A, Main St RR Bridge Removal
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8873205)
1/4/2024 2:00 PM

owner: PW — Pat Zaharako
NAME BID AMOUNT
Bunn Excavating, Inc $75,000.00

Don R Fruchey NO BID

Evers Steel Construction $120,991.00
Exterior Service $70,610.00

Jutte Excavating Inc $43,250.00

Krafft Water $149,325.00
Kreager Group Inc. NO BID

Milestone Contractors LP $116,773.38
Miller Bros. Const., Inc. NO BID

R. L. McCoy, Inc. $139,000.00

Worx Companies NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $75,000.00
#0822S, 2024 Barrett 50/50 Cost Share (eBidDoc# 8891399)
bid date/time: 1/4/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — N Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

Key Concrete $91,276.00

Engineer’s Estimate

$92,355.00 lowest total sum unit cost

#0827S, 2024 Sidewalk Trip Haz (eBidDoc# 8891400)
bid date/time: 1/4/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — N Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

FW Trucking LLC $18.12

Universal Concrete Grinding $18.42

Precision Concrete S44.27

Engineer’s Estimate

$33.00 per cut
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Minutes Bid Opening

#0829P, 2024 Tree Removal Pkg (eBidDoc# 8891401)
bid date/time: 1/4/2024 2:00 PM
owner: PW — N Jarrell
NAME BID AMOUNT

CTC Disaster Response, Inc. NO BID

Monster Tree Service of Fort Wayne $94,970.00
Sunflower Lawn $69,225.00
Wheatcraft Tree and Lawn Service $76,845.00
Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID

Worx Companies $67,005.47
Engineer’s Estimate $86,694.00 lowest total sum unit cost

Adjourn Time: _2:06 pm
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