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Present: Michelle Nelson, Shan Gunawardena, Dawn Ritchie, Dan Shaw, Greg Kreiger and James Reitz. 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0356S, Wheelock Rd Sidewalk                                   (eBidDoc# 8077941) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Key Concrete $552,055.00 

Malott Contracting $504,840.96 

Milestone Contractors  NO BID 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $499,880.00 

 

 

#0360S, Reed Rd Sidewalk                                          (eBidDoc# 8076891) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete  NO BID 

Key Concrete $449,225.00 

Malott Contracting $452,129.00 

Milestone Contractors  NO BID 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $442,060.00 

 

 

#0535D, Alley- W Madison, Jefferson Hanna           (eBidDoc# 8085812) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete Construction $83,749.00 

Key Concrete $98,989.00 

Malott Contracting $94,964.25 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales $98,610.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $109,372.50 
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#0536D, Alley- W Madison, Jefferson Francis          (eBidDoc# 8085813) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $83,167.00 

Key Concrete $93,906.85 

Malott Contracting $98,374.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $108,664.50 

 

 

 

#0537D, Alley- W Madison, Jefferson Harmar         (eBidDoc# 8085814) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete Construction $91,347.00 

Key Concrete $99,740.07 

Malott Contracting $108,933.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $117,771.00 

 

 

 

#0612S, Illinois Rd Sidewalk                                        (eBidDoc# 8077921) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  Dawn Ritchie 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction NO BID 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

E&B Paving NO BID 

Fleming Excavating NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete NO BID 

Key Concrete NO BID 

M&S Excavating NO BID 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Milestone Contractors $1,983,357.08 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,171,666.64 
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#0629N, Fairfield Lighting PH IV                                  (eBidDoc# 8089099) 

bid date/time: 12/30/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works -  Herb Berg 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

City Lights & Signals ll $214,120.00 

Kissinger Electric  $268,360.00 

Shambaugh & Son $417,800.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $307,600.00 

 

 

#66806, Beacon St WM Tap                                         (eBidDoc# 8084754) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2021 14:00 PM 

owner:  City Utilities -  Ben Gensic 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $142,781.00 

Krafft Water Solutions $149,122.00 

M&S Excavating $155,500.00 

Ottenweller Contracting $173,120.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $160,000.00 

 

 

#66987, White Oak Tank                                              (eBidDoc# 8075828) 

bid date/time: 1/6/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Nick Till 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Caldwell Tanks $2,580,000.00 

Kreager Group  NO BID 

Landmark Structures NO BID 

Maguire Iron $2,986,700.00 

Phoenix Fabricators $2,770,500.00 

Pittsburg Tank & Tower Maintenance  NO BID 

Service Electric NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $2,315,000.00 

Adjourn Time: _2 :21 pm 

 


