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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz, Bob Widner, Pat Dooley and Nathan Baggett. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0706D, Alley – E Pontiac, Letih                                 (eBidDoc# 9321311) 

bid date/time: 10/3/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – B Widner 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating LLC $97,199.00 

CF Building Solutions NO BID 

Crystal Creek Concrete $81,037.00 

Exterior Service $113,645.50 

Key Concrete, Inc. $122,155.00 

Malott Contracting, Inc. $98,128.00 

Milestone Contractors LP $119,648.75 

Shannon Concrete  NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $105,697.50 

 

 

#0899N, Lake Ave Street Light                                     (eBidDoc# 9315043) 

bid date/time: 10/3/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – P Dooley 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Indoor Wireless, Inc. $180,053.86 

Pink Lady Contracting, Inc. $367,023.20 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $229,720.00 

 

#76729, 9800 Block Flutter Rd                                     (eBidDoc# 9295779) 

bid date/time: 10/3/2024 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Nathan B 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Advanced Rehabilitation Technology NO BID 

Fleming Excavating Inc $305,355.24 

Pinpoint Directional Drilling Inc $195,055.00 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $195,385.75 

Underground Contractors Inc $240,662.50 

Winhoven Pipeline LLC NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $273,000.00 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:05  pm 


