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Present: Michelle Nelson, Patrick Zaharako, Zak Katter and Matthew Konicek. 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0436X, Production over Spy Run Creek                  (eBidDoc #8056133)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Patrick Zaharako 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Miller Bros. Const $669,320.00 

Pioneer Associates $650,523.00 

Primco LLC. $573,464.63 

R. G. Zachrich Construction $573,895.66 

R. L. McCoy $570,906.74 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $586,207.60 

 

 

**Request for Quote** 

#66912, RFQ FLP Settling Tank Walkways                 (eBidDoc #8062500)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Zak Katter 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Jutte Excavating Inc $70,750.00 

Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. $185,500.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $67,000.00 

 

 

#66959, Tamarack & Blum WMR                                (eBidDoc #8054025)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Austyn Smedberg 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

A & B Boring NO BID 

Fox Contractors $1,878,049.00 

Rothenberger Company Inc $1,846,640.50 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. NO BID 

Underground Contractors Inc NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,791,250.00 
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#67107, Filter Underdrain Replacement                  (eBidDoc #8044541)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Matthew Konicek 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Central Industrial Contractors NO BID 

Current Mechanical NO BID 

Jutte Excavating  $2,528,550.00 

Robert E. Crosby $2,154,000.00 

Thieneman Construction $2,953,000.00 

Wein & Shearer Mechanical NO BID 

WMI LLC $2,659,780.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $2,668,025.00 

 

 

 

#76877, HSW Storage Imp PH III                                  (eBidDoc #8048711)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Zak Katter 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

F.A. Wilhelm Construction $715,000.00 

Kokosing Industrial NO BID 

Ottenweller Contracting $605,000.00 

Robert E. Crosby $687,786.00 

Shambaugh Electrical NO BID 

Thieneman Construction $662,000.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $384,000.00 

 

 

#76881, 2021 Sewer Open Cut 1                               (eBidDoc #8050854)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Eric Steinman 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $575,400.00 

Atlas Excavating NO BID 

Bercot Inc $568,210.00 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Fox Contractors NO BID 

J&L Excavating $466,665.00 

T-E INCORPORATED $592,900.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $639,000.00 
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#76926, 2021 River Intrusion & Manhole                (eBidDoc #8048711)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Khylei Myers 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Advanced Rehabilitation Technology NO BID 

Atlas Excavating NO BID 

Conco Spray Solutions NO BID 

KIM Construction Company NO BID 

Structured Solutions $150,830.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $174,420.00 

 

 

 

**Request for Qualifications** 

#108-10-19-21-1, RFQ FOR CIPP 2022-2024               (eBidDoc #8053996)                                    

bid date/time: 11/18/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Khylei Myers 

NAME RFQ 

Granite Inliner Received 

Inland Waters Pollution Control Received 

Innovative Pipeline Systems NONE 

Insight Pipe Contracting Received 

Insituform Technologies Received 

Miller Pipeline Corp Received 

National Power Rodding Received 

SAK Construction Received 

United Survey NONE 

Visu-Sewer Received 

  
 

Adjourn Time: _2 :20 pm 

 

 

 


