CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

NOVEMBER 2, 2023

Present: Michelle Nelson, Pat Dooley, Judith Chaney, Mike Kiester and Kristen Buell.

Call To Order _2:00 pm

#0820L, E State Blvd Lighting
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8761932)
11/2/2023 2:00 PM

owner: PW — P Dooley
NAME BID AMOUNT
Indoor Wireless, Inc. $76,985.00
Kissinger Electric Inc. NO BID

Michiana Contracting Inc. NO BID

Shambaugh & Son $90,910.00
Engineer’s Estimate $105,980.00
#66993, Crestwood Colony WMR #3 (eBidDoc# 8757738)

bid date/time:

11/2/2023 2:00 PM

owner: CU — A Smedberg
NAME BID AMOUNT

All Seasons Underground NO BID
Environmental Construction NO BID

Exterior Service NO BID

Midwest Trenchless Services $1,759,700.00
Rothenberger Company NO BID

S&S Directional Boring

$2,057,230.00

VTF Excavation

$2,167,085.27

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,955,400.00

Page 1




Minutes Bid Opening

#67088, Auburn & Wallen WME (eBidDoc# 8752082)
bid date/time: 11/2/2023 2:00 PM
owner: CU - B Gensic
NAME BID AMOUNT

All Seasons Underground $452,750.00
Environmental Construction NO BID

Midwest Trenchless Services $498,700.00
Rothenberger Company NO BID

S&S Directional Boring $399,700.00
Underground Contractors $346,525.00

VTF Excavation $426,579.96
Engineer’s Estimate $392,400.00
#76703, Foster Park — WWPS Sewers (eBidDoc# 8745809)
bid date/time: 11/2/2023 2:00 PM
owner: CU —K Buell

NAME BID AMOUNT

API Construction $4,353,970.00
Atlas Excavating, $6,721,954.00
Bunn $4,567,985.00
Dunigan Bros., $6,522,566.30
Fleming Excavating $3,804,586.31
Engineer’s Estimate $8,237,049.00

Adjourn Time: _2:10 pm
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