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Present: Michelle Nelson, Shan Gunawardena, Steve Williams and Ezra Broman. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

 

#0515C, Fairfield Terrace                                              (eBidDoc# 8335961) 

bid date/time: 12/1/2022 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Ezra Broman 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete  $2,777,777.77 

Key Concrete $2,218,545.00 

Ley Excavating NO BID 

M&S Excavating NO BID 

Malott Contracting $2,133,950.46 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $2,422,914.00 

 

 

#67055, Filter Backwash Retention Tank                  (eBidDoc# 8303946) 

bid date/time: 12/1/2022 2:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities –  Nick Till 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Ottenweller Contracting $840,310.00 

R. G. Zachrich Construction $1,005,700.00 

S&S Directional Boring NO BID 

Underground Contractors NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,259,900.00 

 

 

#67261, FLP to WWPS Electrical Intertie                   (Q 8317881) 

bid date/time: 12/1/2022 2:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Steve Williams  

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bunn, Inc NO BID 

Electric Power Systems NO BID 

Service Electric NO BID 

Shambaugh Electrical $819,345.00 

Spectrum Engineering NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $465,000.00 
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#83723, Westmoor Addition Imp                                (eBidDoc# 8326874) 

bid date/time: 12/1/2022 2:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities –   Matthew Grieger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Atlas Excavating NO BID 

Bercot Inc $425,605.00 

Bunn, Inc NO BID 

Crosby Excavating $407,838.00 

Exterior Service $299,999.99 

Fox Contractors $425,481.00 

Krafft Water Solutions $306,970.10 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $394,595.00 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:10 pm 
 


