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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz, Michael Kiester, Eric Steinman and Patrick Zaharako. 

 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

66799 - Southwest Tank Painting                                                   (eBidDoc #6582369) 

Bid date/time: 12/12/2019 14:00 

Owner: City Utilities – Steve Fickle 

  

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Classic Protective Coatings Inc. $1,944,858.00 

D&M Painting Corporation $1,193,940.00 

fedewa inc NO BID 

G&L Tank Sandblasting and Coatings LLC NO BID 

Indy Blasting LLC NO BID 

INSPEC COATINGS,INC. NO BID 

l and t painting inc NO BID 

LC United Painting $1,128,000.00 

Quest Construction Data Network NO BID 

Semper Fi Industrial Coatings NO BID 

Seven Brothers Painting $974,800.00 

TMI Coatings, Inc. $2,456,000.00 

TSP Services, Inc NO BID 

ucl inc NO BID 

Utility Service Co. Inc.  $1,664,700.00 

Viking Industrial Painting $1,520,000.00 

Worldwide Industries Corp. $1,211,650.00 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $1,038,000.00 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
           OVER  

 

 

 



Minutes Bid Opening September 18, 2018 
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76735 - Pettit-Rudisill Neighborhood Sewer Open Cuts                      (eBidDoc #6572606) 

Bid date/time: 12/12/2019 14:00 

Owner: City Utilities – Eric Steinman 

  

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction NO BID 

Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID 

Bercot Inc $534,021.00 

Bunn, Inc $383,850.00 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Rothenberger Company Inc NO BID 

T-E INCORPORATED $500,000.00 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $357,000.00 

 
 

 

83453 - Brookside Parkerdale Drainage Improvements             (eBidDoc #6581717) 

Bid date/time: 12/12/2019 14:00 

Owner: City Utilities – Kristen Buell 

  

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $1,553,891.25 

Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID 

Bunn, Inc $1,903,249.35 

Crosby Excavating $1,473,883.50 

Fox Contractors  $1,731,408.43 

Geiger Excavating NO BID 

Ironclad Excavating Inc NO BID 

Rothenberger Company Inc NO BID 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. NO BID 

Underground Contractors Inc NO BID 

Watson Excavating Inc. Redkey NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $1,624,450.00 

 

 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _2 :10 pm 


