CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
MINUTES e DECEMBER 5, 2019

Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Shan Gunawardena, Ron Shephard, Charlie Cochran,
Nathan Baggett, Chris Ravenscroft and Craig Berndt.

Call To Order _2:00 pm

66533 - Three Rivers Filtration Plant Batch (eBidDoc #6567900)

Bid date/time: 12/5/2019 14:00
Owner: City Utilities — Chris Ravenscroft
COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT

Jutte Excavating Inc

$2,348,000.00

Ottenweller Contracting, LLC.

$2,034,665.00

Project Design and Piping, Inc. NO BID
RDP Technologies, Inc NO BID
Robert E. Crosby, Inc $1,989,898.00
Wein & Shearer Mechanical, Inc. NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,870,000.00

76488 - Flaugh Road Sanitary Sewer Extension
Bid date/time:

(eBidDoc #6566943)
12/5/2019 14:00

Owner: City Utilities — Nathan Baggett
COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT
API Construction $554,160.00
Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID
Bercot Inc NO BID

Bunn, Inc $586,100.00
Crosby Excavating $531,793.00
Dunigan Bros., Inc. $821,275.90
Exterior Service NO BID

Fox Contractors $746,884.00
Global Paving $830,959.77
HPH Mechanical (Hanks Plumbing & Heating NO BID
Ironclad Excavating Inc $537,837.00
Lykins Contracting NO BID
MIDWEST MOLE, INC NO BID
Rothenberger Company Inc NO BID
Watson Excavating Inc. Redkey NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$598,750.00

OVER mmmliiee--
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Minutes Bid Opening

83619 - Limberlost Acres Drainage Imp. (eBidDoc #6572311)

Bid date/time: 12/5/2019 14:00
Owner: City Utilities — Charlie Cochran
COMPANY NAME DESIGNATION

API Construction $396,600.00

Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID

Bercot Inc $618,526.00

Bunn, Inc $493,495.00

Crosby Excavating $573,131.50

Ironclad Excavating Inc NO BID

Krafft Water Solutions, LLC. NO BID

Rothenberger Company Inc NO BID

T-E INCORPORATED $469,003.00

Watson Excavating Inc. Redkey NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $532,145.00

Adjourn Time: _2 :10 pm

Page 2



