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Present: Michelle Nelson and Jacob Fowler. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#83788, Braun Drain Ph I                                             (eBidDoc# 8813268) 

bid date/time: 12/7/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – V Meyer 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $671,645.00  

Atlas Excavating, Inc. $1,146,420.00  

Bercot Inc $687,089.00  

Bunn Excavating, Inc $584,658.00  
Exterior Service NO BID 

Fleming Excavating Inc $943,556.41  
Fox Contractors NO BID 

Krafft Water Solutions, LLC. $424,416.50  
Ottenweller Contracting, LLC. NO BID 

Will Power Excavation NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $857,597.50  

 

 

#83912, Hessen Cassel & Southwin                          (eBidDoc# 8823131) 

bid date/time: 12/7/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – J Fowler 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $174,562.00  

Brooks Construction  $150,518.00  

Bunn Excavating, Inc $145,345.00  
Crawford Excavating NO BID 

Crosby Excavating $193,015.00  

Exterior Service $187,014.00  

Fleming Excavating Inc $158,748.64  
Fox Contractors NO BID 

Krafft Water Solutions $109,461.50  

Ottenweller Contracting $295,000.00  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $158,895.00  
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#110-11-7-23-1, CU 2024 Asphalt Cut Repair         (eBidDoc# 8803435) 

bid date/time: 12/7/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Joe Johnson 

NAME RFQ Rec’d 

Robboc Inc. Rec’d 

 

 

#110-11-7-23-2, CU 2024 Concrete Cut Repair         (eBidDoc# 8803436) 

bid date/time: 12/7/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Joe Johnson 

NAME RFQ  

Robboc Inc. Rec’d 

 

 

#Q 8811186, RFQ Stellhorn Trail                               (eBidDoc# 8811186) 

bid date/time: 12/7/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – D Ritchie 

NAME RFQ  

A&Z Engineering, LLC  
All American Express Solutions  
American Structurepoint  
Apex Consulting & Surveying, Inc. Rec’d 

Asphalt Maintenance Service  
Butler, Fairman &Seufert, Inc Rec’d 

DLZ Indiana, LLC Rec’d 

E&B Paving Inc.  
Engineering Resources, Inc.  
Fleis & VandenBrink Rec’d 

GAI Rec’d 

JPR - Fort Wayne Rec’d 

USI Consultants-IN  
VS Engineering, Inc.  

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:09 pm 


