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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, James Reitz, Bob Widner, Nick Jarrell, Steve Muston and Bradley Lewis. 

 

#0121C, Arlington Pk Repairs Ph 3                             (eBidDoc# 8113436) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Bob Widner 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Hipskind Concrete $1,296,213.50 

Key Concrete NO BID 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Milestone Contractors  $1,699,013.99 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,309,676.40 

 

#0546B, Brick Alley: Berry, Wayne, Union                (eBidDoc# 8110219) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – James Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Key Concrete $117,000.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales $118,727.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $115,390.00 

 

#0621S, 2022 Barrett 50/50 Cost Share                   (eBidDoc# 8111271) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete $91,455.00 

Malott Contracting $92,325.14 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $92,065.00 

 

#0640S, 2022 Misc. Concrete Pkg                              (eBidDoc# 8111275) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete $91,595.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $92,065.00 
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#0641U, 2022 ADA Ramp Pkg                                     (eBidDoc# 8111268) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete $76,200.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $76,890.00 

 

 

#0642C, 2022 Curb Pkg                                                 (eBidDoc# 8111272) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete $46,107.00 

Malott Contracting $46,409.50 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $46,378.00 

 

 

#0643S, 2022 Sidewalk Trip Hazard                            (eBidDoc# 8111274) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

American Sidewalk Management NO BID 

Garcia Concrete Construction $27.50 

Next Level Surfaces NO BID 

Precision Concrete Cutting $27.48 

Universal Concrete Grinding $21.45 

We Fix Sidewalks $5.95 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $31.20 

 

 

#0645P, 2022 Tree Removal Pkg                                (eBidDoc# 8111277) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Arborcare NO BID 

J. Ranck Electric NO BID 

Monster Tree Service of Fort Wayne $172,485.00 

Wheatcraft Tree and Lawn Service $154,925.00 

Worx Companies  
  

Engineer’s Estimate $73,880.00 
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#0646P, 2022 Guardrail & Attenuator                       (eBidDoc# 8111270) 

bid date/time: 2/10/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Specialties Company $107,000.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $100,000.00 

 

 

Adjourned: 2:20pm  


