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Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Shan Gunawardena, Patrick Zaharako and Nick Jarrell via 

Phone. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

0519U, 2021 ADA Ramp Pkg                                                                         (eBidDoc #7489249) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $78,339.00 

Key Concrete $78,148.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $79,590.00  total sum of unit price 

 

 

0520S, 2021 Barrett Pkg                                                                               (eBidDoc #7491494) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 
owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Garcia Concrete  $196,118.00 

Key Concrete $196,102.00 

Malott Contracting $196,474.50 

Next Level Surfaces NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $197,590.00 total sum of unit price 
 

 

0521S, 2021 Misc. ROW Concrete Pkg                                                       (eBidDoc #7491459) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $166,145.75 

Key Concrete $166,122.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  

Engineer’s Estimate $167,590.00 total sum of unit price 
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0522S, 2021 Sidewalk Trip Haz Elim                                                           (eBidDoc #7524575) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

ASTI Sawing $25.67 

Hard Rock Concrete Cutters $31.95 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Next Level Surfaces NO BID 

Precision Concrete $24.93 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $31.20 total sum of unit price 

 

 

0523P, 2021 Tree Removal Pkg                                                                   (eBidDoc #7505728) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

J. Ranck Electric NO BID 

Ransom Tree Service  $26,750.00 

Sunflower Lawn and Landscaping $25,389.00 

Wheatcraft Tree $39,670.00 

Worx Companies $25,336.19 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $33,875.00 total sum of unit price 

 

 

 

0524P, 2021 Guardrail & Attenuator Replacement                                 (eBidDoc #7505715) 

bid date/time: 2/11/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Specialties Company $84,000.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $79,500.00 total sum of unit price 

 

Adjourn Time: _2 : 08pm 
 

 


