CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
AGENDA e FEBRUARY 17, 2022

Present: Michelle Nelson, Ron Sheppard, Dan Shaw, Charlie Cochran, Kristen Buell, Tim Byer, Kelvin Ramsey,
Shan Gunawardena and Mike Kiester.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0028C, Miller Ridge Repairs (eBidDoc# 8117814)

bid date/time: 2/17/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Tim Byer
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Hipskind Concrete $1,023.521.00

Key Concrete NO BID

Malott Contracting $963,648.06

Milestone Contractors $1,096,277.55
Engineer’s Estimate $956,384.00

#0238P, Flood buyout - Brown/Eby (eBidDoc# 8115685)
bid date/time: *INVITATIONAL* 2/17/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Patrick Zaharako
NAME BID AMOUNT

Kreager Group Inc. $17,677.00

Worx Companies $24,058.00

Engineer’s Estimate $22,300.00

#0513C, Winterfield Community (eBidDoc# 8113473)

bid date/time: 2/17/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Dan Shaw
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Hipskind Concrete $3,157,852.50

Key Concrete NO BID

Malott Contracting NO BID

Milestone Contractors $3,577,536.36
Engineer’s Estimate $2,806,655.23
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#0545D, Alley: Packard, Darrow, Calhoun

(eBidDoc# 8117816)

bid date/time: 2/17/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Tim Byer
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Key Concrete $125,685.00

Malott Contracting $116,353.20

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $130,464.00

#0567D, Alley: Packard, Kinsmoor, Fairfield
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8106946)
2/17/2022 14:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Greg McDirmit
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Key Concrete $71,000.00

Malott Contracting $68,842.70

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $74,972.00

#76698, CSO 55 / Anthony & Wayne (eBidDoc# 8104727)

bid date/time:

2/17/2022 14:00 PM

owner: City Utilities - Veronika Meyer
NAME BID AMOUNT

API Construction $1,462,711.25

Atlas Excavating, Inc. NO BID

Bunn, Inc NO BID

Fleming Excavating Inc

$1,922,782.88

Rothenberger Company Inc

$1,502,650.00

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,244,890.00

#83736, Heather Ridge & Aboite Cntr
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8104724)
2/17/2022 14:00 PM

owner: City Utilities - Vannesa Mendoza
NAME BID AMOUNT

Atlas Excavating NO BID

Bercot Inc $254,231.00

J&L Excavating $320,020.00

Krafft Water Solutions $156,945.00

T-E Incorporated NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $236,550.00

Adjourn Time: _2:19 pm
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