CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220

MARCH 16, 2023

Present: Michelle Nelson, Shan Gunawardena, Stephen Williams, Dan Shaw and Greg Kreiger.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0596D, Alley- McKee, Colerick
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8406348)
3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Dan Shaw
NAME BID AMOUNT

Campos Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $120,060.00

Garcia Concrete $104,571.00

Key Concrete $95,000.00

Malott Contracting $97,968.00

Engineer’s Estimate $130,225.00

#0656D, Alley — Nuttman, Oakdale
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8407429)
3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Dan Shaw
NAME BID AMOUNT

Campos Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $148,737.50

Garcia Concrete $191,197.50

Key Concrete $137,705.00

Malott Contracting $159,796.00

Engineer’s Estimate

$179,027.50

#0661A, 2023 Resurfacing SW
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8409604)
3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Greg Kreiger
NAME BID AMOUNT

Brooks Construction $1,857,646.25

E&B Paving $1,606,484.50

Exterior Service NO BID

Malott Contracting NO BID

Wayne Asphalt NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,710,149.50

Page 1




Minutes

Bid Opening

#0663A, 2023 Resurfacing NE

bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8410688)

3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Bob Widner
NAME BID AMOUNT

Brooks Construction $1,746,902.25

E&B Paving $1,595,763.25

Exterior Service NO BID

Wayne Asphalt $1,563,397.80

Engineer’s Estimate

$1,728,087.30

#66970, 3RFP MCC-S/S1
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8387148)
3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: City Utilities — Steve Williams
NAME BID AMOUNT

Hi-Tech Electric $116,724.00

Shambaugh & Son $165,560.00

Trisco Systems NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $190,000.00

#76920, WPCP MCC-P4 (eBidDoc# 8397675)

bid date/time:

3/16/2023 2:00 PM

owner: City Utilities — Steve Williams
NAME BID AMOUNT

Hi-Tech Electric $358,224.00

Shambaugh & Son $240,730.00

Engineer’s Estimate $330,000.00

Adjourn Time: _2:07 pm
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