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Present: Michelle Nelson, Angela Erpelding, Brian Kiess and Nick Jarrell. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0512C, Heather Ridge Repairs                                   (eBidDoc# 8395473) 

bid date/time: 3/2/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Brian Kiess 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete  $3,222,462.00 

Key Concrete $3,256,550.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Milestone Contractors  $3,994,136.64 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $3,256,000.00 

 

 

#0595D, Alley – Darrow, Oakdale, Harrison             (eBidDoc# 8395476) 

bid date/time: 3/2/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Brian Kiess 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating $98,538.00 

Exterior Service $108,097.00 

Garcia Concrete  $100,883.00 

Key Concrete $90,783.00 

Malott Contracting $94,330.61 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $126,600.00 

 

 

#0652X, Progress Pkwy Bridge                                    (eBidDoc# 8389350) 

bid date/time: 3/2/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Patrick Zaharako 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Milestone Contractors  $887,612.85 

Pioneer Associates $782,656.15 

R. L. McCoy $873,114.40 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $681,744.50 
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#0677C, Pettit – Rudisill Ph III                                      (eBidDoc# 8394391) 

bid date/time: 3/2/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Dan Shaw 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $544,228.00 

Hipskind Concrete $534,914.00 

Key Concrete $438,315.00 

Malott Contracting $641,820.50 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $535,940.00 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:10 pm 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 


