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Present: Michelle Nelson, Dan Shaw, Greg Kreiger and Matt Ramsay. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0597D, Alley – Colerick, Dalman                              (eBidDoc# 8414004) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg Kreiger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service $111,590.00 

Garcia Concrete  $129,937.50 

Key Concrete $116,535.00 

Malott Contracting $98,011.90 

  
Engineer’s estimate $125,175.00 

 

 

#0607D, Alley - Maxine, Clermont                            (eBidDoc# 8414048) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Matt Ramsay 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service $81,015.00 

Garcia Concrete  $68,185.00 

Key Concrete $69,130.00 

Malott Contracting $70,122.85 

  
Engineer’s estimate $97,705.00 

 

 

 

#0633D, Alley -  E Wayne, E Washington                  (eBidDoc# 8414005) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg Kreiger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating $87,305.00 

Exterior Service $105,975.00 

Garcia Concrete  $97,278.00 

Key Concrete $99,915.00 

Malott Contracting $94,090.00 

Woodruff Contracting  NO BID 

  
Engineer’s estimate $114,830.00 
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#0660A, Resurfacing SE                                                (eBidDoc# 8416127) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg Kreiger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction NO BID 

Brooks Construction  $1,573,076.06 

E&B Paving $1,548,710.00 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s estimate $1,531,506.00 

 

 

#0662A, Resurfacing NW                                             (eBidDoc# 8414049) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Matt Ramsay 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction NO BID  

Brooks Construction $1,373,576.98 

E&B Paving $1,306,437.50 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s estimate $1,596,827.50 

 

 

****RFQ**** 

#67085, St Joe Dam Sediment Removal                    (eBidDoc# 8414000) 

bid date/time: 3/23/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities – Zak Katter 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Ballard Marine Construction  
Fox Contractors  
J.F. Brennan Company  
MERRELL BROS INC  
Michels Marine  
Paragon Integrated Services   
Ransom Tree Service  
Solomon Diving Docs Rec’d 

Taplin Group  
Woodruff Contracting   
  

  

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:08 pm 


