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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz, Ron Sheppard, Phil Labrash, Mason Gamble and Shan 

Gunawardena. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0624X, Parnell Ave Bridge Rehab                          (eBidDoc# 9583126) 

bid date/time: 3/27/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW - Mason 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

E&B Paving Bridge Division NO BID 

Milestone Contractors LP $2,687,878.77  
Pioneer Associates, Inc. NO BID 

R. L. McCoy, Inc. NO BID 

Woodruff Contracting and Sales NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $2,181,601.65 

 

 

#0799D, Alley – Kinnaird, Packard                          (eBidDoc# 9574648) 

bid date/time: 3/27/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Tim  

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating LLC $165,000.00  
Crystal Creek Concrete $178,034.00  
Key Concrete, Inc. $190,550.00  
Malott Contracting, Inc. $180,006.00  
SHANNON CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION $175,660.00  
Vino Concrete Construction LLC $168,670.00  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $187,970.00 

 

 

#0894C, Centennial Pk Repairs Ph II                          (eBidDoc# 9574651) 

bid date/time: 3/27/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: PW - Tim 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction Co Inc. $987,128.00  
Campos Excavating LLC NO BID 

Key Concrete, Inc. $1,362,075.00  
Milestone Contractors LP NO BID 

MS Concrete LP NO BID 

wayne asphalt $1,028,732.50  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,303,393.00 
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#67436, Cinderella Village WME                                (eBidDoc# 9551424) 

bid date/time: 3/27/2025 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Kyle V 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Fox Contractors $1,168,223.00  
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC NO BID 

Miller Contracting Group, Inc. NO BID 

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $1,082,280.00  

  
Engineer’s Estimate $967,595.00 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:07  pm 


