
CITY OF FORT WAYNE 

BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING 

200 E BERRY STREET -  STE 210 ROOM 220 

AGENDA ● MARCH 4 2021 
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Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Shan Gunawardena, Patrick Zaharako and Dan Shaw. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

0447D, Alley: E Pontiac, Colerick, Lillie, S Anthony                                   (eBidDoc #7581498) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Dan Shaw 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete  $161,825.00 

Key Concrete $159,305.00 

Malott Contracting $157,976.90 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $180,532.50 

 

 

0454D, Alley: Creighton, Milan, S Anthony, Lillie                                     (eBidDoc #7367926) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Dan Shaw 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete $87,987.50 

Key Concrete $93,569.00 

Malott Contracting $95,591.10 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $102,852.50 

 

 

 

0487A, 2021 Resurfacing Pkg SE                                                                   (eBidDoc #7577746) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – James Reitz 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction $1,109,780.00 

City Lights & Signals ll,  NO BID 

E&B Paving $1,010,749.40 

wayne asphalt $1,012,837.40 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,046,721.80 
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0498C, Sherwood to Pettit Neighborhood                                                (eBidDoc #7577862) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – James Reitz 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Garcia Concrete $628,375.00 

Hipskind Concrete $644,444.10 

Key Concrete $663,510.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $620,182.00 

 

 

76878, Coldwater Rd Force Main Redirection                                        (eBidDoc #7491542) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Nathan Baggett 

COMPANY NAME BID AMOUNT 

Bercot Inc $62,267.00 

Crosby Excavating $69,940.00 

HPH Mechanical  $70,723.64 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $55,600.00 
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RFQ’s 

RFQ 76916 – WPCP Coarse Screen Clearning Pn II                                   (eBidDoc #7585772) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Zak Katter 

COMPANY NAME Quote Rec’d 

  
NONE REC’D 

 

 

RFQ 76932 – WPCP Pond Capacity Restoration PH III                             (eBidDoc #7585877) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Zak Katter 

COMPANY NAME Quote Rec’d 

Metropolitan Environmental Services $366,025.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $139,700.00 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _2 :15pm  
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RFP 

 

Call To Order  _12 :00 pm 

RFP – 2021-CUE-ESP001 CU Energy Sustainability                                    (eBidDoc #7487233) 

bid date/time: 3/4/2021 12:00 PM 

 #    RFP 2021-CUE-ESP001 City Utilities -  Zach Schortgen 

COMPANY NAME Quote Rec’d 

Ameresco Rec’d 

Energy Power Partners Rec’d 

Generate Organic Waste Services Rec’d 

Harrison Street Rec’d 

JMS, A Veregy Company Rec’d 

Johnson Controls Rec’d 

Kendall Eaton Rec’d 

NOVI Energy Rec’d 

Schneider Electric Rec’d 

Solential Energy Rec’d 
 

 

Adjourn Time: _12:05pm 
 


