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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz Greg Kreiger, Matt Ramsay, Kyle Winling,Dawn Ritchie, Kevin 

Hicks, Lucas Revis and Tod Schlachter. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0281R, Hanna St Trail                                                  (eBidDoc# 8178218) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg Kreiger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete NO BID 

Key Concrete $843,049.00 

Malott Contracting $998,895.73 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $784,798.00 

 

 

 

#0560A, 2022 Resurfacing Pkg NW                           (eBidDoc# 8176076) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Matt Ramsay 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction  $1,542,053.00 

E&B Paving  $1,373,869.00 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,270,936.25 

 

 

#0561A, 2022 Resurfacing SE                                        (eBidDoc# 8177186) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg Kreiger 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Brooks Construction $1,253,564.00 

E&B Paving Inc. $1,214,887.00 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,269,123.29 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Minutes Bid Opening  

 Page 2   

#0565D, Alley- Greenlawn, Archer, Andrew             (eBidDoc# 8176112) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Matt Ramsay 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Exterior Service $69,538.50 

Key Concrete $78,715.00 

Malott Contracting $75,932.60 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $81,057.50 

 

 

 

#76925, WPCP Pond 2-3 Gate                                     (eBidDoc# 8163072) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Chris Ravenscroft 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Ottenweller Contracting $685,261.65 

Shambaugh Electrical NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $450,414.65 

 

 

 

#76946, FLP to WWPS Power                                       (eBidDoc# 8158804) 

bid date/time: 4/28/2022 14:00 PM 

owner: City Utilities -  Austyn Smedberg 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

A & B Boring NO BID 

Fox Contractors NO BID 

Rothenberger Company  $710,120.00 

S&S Directional Boring $745,640.00 

Shambaugh Electrical NO BID 

Winhoven Pipeline  $848,605.20 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $675,540.00 

 

Adjourn Time: _2:08  pm 

 

 

 

 


