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Present: Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Tania Schwarz, Brian Kiess, Patrick Zaharako, Michelle Peterson and Dawn 

Ritchie. 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0168N, Liberty Mills Trail                                           (eBidDoc# 8496878) 

bid date/time: 5/18/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Brian Kiess 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

API Construction $1,493,600.00 

Brooks Construction  NO BID 

Bunn, Inc $1,919,425.00 

E&B Paving  NO BID 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Fleming Excavating  NO BID 

Milestone Contractors  $1,818,027.80 

Shambaugh & Son NO BID 

Wayne Asphalt NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $1,388,030.60 

 

#0657D, Alley – Branning, Lexington, Clinton         (eBidDoc# 8496871) 

bid date/time: 5/18/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Dan Shaw 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Campos Excavating  NO BID 

Exterior Service $279,121.00 

Garcia Concrete  $300,797.50 

Key Concrete $249,478.00 

Malott Contracting $297,347.96 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $311,412.50 

 

#0678C, Woodland Lake                                              (eBidDoc# 8491124) 

bid date/time: 5/18/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Greg McDirmit 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating NO BID 

Garcia Concrete NO BID 

Hipskind Concrete $2,594,344.21 

Key Concrete NO BID 

Malott Contracting $3,448,612.54 

Milestone Contractors  $2,865,811.72 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $3,201,135.00 
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#0775S, ROW Misc Pkg B                                              (eBidDoc# 8498965) 

bid date/time: 5/18/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: Public Works – Nick Jarrell 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service $92,090.00 

Garcia Concrete  $91,178.00 

Key Concrete $91,199.00 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $92,296.00 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2: 08pm 


