CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
MINUTES e JUNE 30, 2022

Present: Michelle Nelson, Brian Kiess, Dawn Ritchie, Matt Gray, Stacy Haviland and Ezra Broman.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0424R, Hanna St Trail — Decatur to Pettit (eBidDoc# 8232135)

bid date/time: 6/30/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Dawn/Brian
NAME BID AMOUNT

Brooks Construction $704,917.00

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Key Concrete NO BID

Malott Contracting $566,825.67

Engineer’s Estimate

$656,915.00

#0569D, Alley — Lewis, Hugh, McCulloch

(eBidDoc# 8233205)

bid date/time: 6/30/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Ezra Broman
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $154,046.25

Garcia Concrete $162,878.50

Key Concrete $127,781.00

Malott Contracting $154,856.65

Engineer’s Estimate

$149,995.00

#0574C, Pettit Rudisill Neighborhood Ph 2
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8233204)
6/30/2022 14:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Greg Kreiger
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Garcia Concrete $767,725.00

Hipskind Concrete NO BID

Key Concrete $542,490.00

Malott Contracting $646,178.00

Milestone Contractors $876,110.31

Engineer’s Estimate

$657,155.00
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Minutes Bid Opening

#0617N, Superior St Urban Trail (eBidDoct#t 8233202)

bid date/time: 6/30/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Comm Dev — Holly Petzak
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

DHM Contracting NO BID

Harlow Enterprises NO BID

Key Concrete $1,196,418.00

Malott Contracting $1,098,949.37

Engineer’s Estimate $1,152,910.00

Adjourn Time: _2:07 pm
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