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Present: Michelle Nelson, Shan Gunawardena, Pat Dooley, Matthew Gray, Anna Baer and Dan Shaw. 

 

Call To Order  _2 :00 pm 

#0676D, Alley Branning, Lexington                          (eBidDoc# 8572461) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – T Byer 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating $86,767.50 

Exterior Service $90,350.00 

Key Concrete $63,540.00 

Ley Excavating NO BID 

Malott Contracting $78,013.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $76,775.00 

 

 

#0696D, Alley Suttenfield, Pontiac                            (eBidDoc# 8565390) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – J Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating $117,319.00 

Exterior Service $115,922.00 

Key Concrete $87,320.00 

Ley Excavating NO BID 

Malott Contracting $96,119.01 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $136,745.00 

 

 

#0704D, Alley Richardsville, Baxter                           (eBidDoc# 8565388) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – J Reitz 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Crosby Excavating $88,740.00 

Exterior Service $83,186.50 

Key Concrete $66,451.00 

Ley Excavating NO BID 

Malott Contracting $74,718.50 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $105,590.00 

 

#0737B, Swinney Brick Repair                                    (eBidDoc# 8561133) 
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bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – D Shaw 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Key Concrete $272,845.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $249,985.00 

 

#0742T, Bluffton Corridor Signal Upgrade                (eBidDoc# 8567471) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Anna B/Brad F 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Michiana Contracting  $149,900.00 

Shambaugh & Son $89,425.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $106,175.00 

 

#0770T, Anthony & McKinnie Signal                         (eBidDoc# 8552174) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – Anna B 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Exterior Service NO BID 

Malott Contracting NO BID 

Michiana Contracting $199,550.00 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $161,095.00 

 

#0776L, 1700 Blk Fourth Lighting REBID                   (eBidDoc# 8552192) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: PW – P Dooley 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

Indoor Wireless, Inc. $27,424.00 

Michiana Contracting Inc. NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $35,810.00 

 

#75457, Till Rd Septic                                                    (eBidDoc# 8558224) 

bid date/time: 7/13/2023 2:00 PM 

owner: CU – Michael S 

NAME BID AMOUNT 

S&S Directional Boring $234,042.00 

Underground Contractors NO BID 

  
Engineer’s Estimate $196,920.00 

 

 

Adjourn Time: _ 2:10 pm 


