CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING
200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
AGENDA e JULY 29, 2021

Present: Michelle Nelson, Michelle Fulk-Vondran, Patrick Zaharako, Matt Ramsay, Kelly White, Kelvin Ramsay
and Zak Katter.
Call To Order 2 :00 pm

#0383B, Brick Alley Recon (eBidDoc #7922368)
bid date/time: 7/29/2021 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — James Reitz
NAME BID AMOUNT

Garcia Concrete NO BID

Key Concrete $98,128.00
Engineer’s Estimate $99,136.00

#0493A, White Oak Concrete Repairs (eBidDoc #7926625)
bid date/time: 7/29/2021 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Matt Ramsay
NAME BID AMOUNT

Brooks Construction $737,413.00

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service NO BID

Garcia Concrete NO BID

Harlow Enterprise NO BID

Liberty Developing NO BID

Primco Inc. NO BID

Wayne Asphalt $699,433.00
Engineer’s Estimate $801,310.00
#0564D, Alley Recon: Irene, Goshen, Hensch (eBidDoc #7926617)
bid date/time: 7/29/2021 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Matt Ramsay
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $46,067.50

Garcia Concrete NO BID

Key Concrete $44,256.00

Malott Contracting $48,976.05

MS Concrete

Engineer’s Estimate $55,910.00

#76802, WPCP MCC-P1 Replacement 2021 (eBidDoc #7882971)
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Minutes Bid Opening

bid date/time: 7/29/2021 14:00 PM

owner: City Utilities — Steve Williams
NAME BID AMOUNT

Eberle Electric NO BID

Service Electric $234,640.00

Shambaugh Electrical $220,360.00

Engineer’s Estimate $255,000.00

#83843, Science Central Rain Garden Replanting (eBidDoc #7931832)

bid date/time: 7/29/2021 14:00 PM

owner: City Utilities — Veronika Meyer
NAME BID AMOUNT

Cardno $29,524.00

Davey Resource Group NO BID

Exterior Service $28,448.00

The Stanger Group NO BID

Worx Companies $19,992.36

Engineer’s Estimate $14,540.00

Adjourn Time: _2:09 pm
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