CITY OF FORT WAYNE
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
AGENDA e SEPTEMBER 29, 2022

Present: Michelle Nelson, Dan Shaw, Greg Kreiger and Hayley Bandi.

Call ToOrder 2 :00 pm

#0340S, Winchester Sidewalk Ph 1 (eBidDoc# 8295031)
bid date/time: 9/29/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — Brian Kiess
NAME BID AMOUNT
Crosby Excavating NO BID

DC Construction Services $413,522.60

Exterior Service NO BID

Hipskind Concrete $255,225.00

Key Concrete $272,170.00

Malott Contracting $264,866.30
Engineer’s Estimate $287,830.00

#0544D, Alley- Wildwood, Packard, Calhoun
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8294482)
9/29/2022 14:00 PM

owner: Public Works — Greg McDirmit
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $132,045.50

Key Concrete, Inc. $108,458.00

Malott Contracting, Inc. $112,259.10

Engineer’s Estimate

$149,979.00

#0604D, Alley- Foster, Branning, Wayne
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8288728)
9/29/2022 14:00 PM

owner: Public Works — James Reitz
NAME BID AMOUNT

Campos Excavating NO BID

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $90,206.00

Key Concrete, Inc. $74,240.00

Malott Contracting $76,996.15

Engineer’s Estimate

$101,451.00
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Bid Opening

#0608D, Alley- Clermont, Pasadena, Wayne (eBidDoct#t 8288729)

bid date/time: 9/29/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — James Reitz
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Exterior Service $71,276.00

Key Concrete $57,088.00

Malott Contracting $62,028.13

Engineer’s Estimate $84,242.50

#0659B, Brick Alley- Berry, Wayne, Clay (eBidDoc# 8288731)

bid date/time: 9/29/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — James Reitz
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

Key Concrete $110,390.00

Malott Contracting $128,910.68

Engineer’s Estimate $137,654.40

#0694D, Alley- Jefferson, Lewis, Lafayette (eBidDoc# 8288733)

bid date/time: 9/29/2022 14:00 PM
owner: Public Works — James Reitz
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

DC Construction Services $178,503.85

Exterior Service $131,854.50

Key Concrete $94,310.00

Malott Contracting $104,493.73

Engineer’s Estimate

$111,437.50

#67085, St Joe Dam Intake Sediment Removal

(eBidDoc# 8286507)

bid date/time: 9/29/2022 14:00 PM
owner: City Utilities — Zak Katter
NAME BID AMOUNT
Ballard Marine Construction NO BID

J.F. Brennan Company NO BID

Merrell Bros Inc NO BID
Metropolitan Environmental Services NO BID

Noble Environmental Specialty Services NO BID

Solomon Diving NO BID

Taplin Group $313,872.86
Engineer’s Estimate $129,350.00
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Minutes

Bid Opening

#109-9-13-22-1, Fairfield Streetscape
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 8295032)
9/29/2022 14:00 PM

owner: Comm Redev — Holly Petzak
NAME BID AMOUNT

Crosby Excavating NO BID

DHM Contracting NO BID

Exterior Service NO BID

Key Concrete $253,795.00

Malott Contracting $319,116.06

Worx Companies NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate

$283,955.75

Adjourn Time: _2:13 pm
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