Present: Michelle Nelson, Ron Sheppard, Timothy Zimmerman, Phil Labrash, James Reitz, Kristen Buell, Annabell

Novak, Nick Ruppley.

CITY OF FORT WAYNE

BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS * PUBLIC BID OPENING

200 E BERRY STREET - STE 210 ROOM 220
APRIL 24, 2025

Call To Order 2 :00 pm
#0969T, W Washington & College (eBidDoc# 9628351)
bid date/time: 4/24/2025 2:00 PM
owner: PW —JamesR
NAME BID AMOUNT
Indoor Wireless, Inc. $255,451.82
Shambaugh & Son, $336,721.00
Engineer’s Estimate $305,243.00
#0972T, 2025 Misc Striping (eBidDoct# 9630444)
bid date/time: 4/24/2025 2:00 PM
owner: PW — Ethan B
NAME BID AMOUNT
A&A Safety, Inc. NO BID
CE Hughes Milling, Inc. $88,179.00
Engineer’s Estimate $57,734.90
#67365, Carroll Rd WME (eBidDoc# 9614377)

bid date/time:

4/24/2025 2:00 PM

owner: CU - Ben Gensic
NAME BID AMOUNT
Fleming Excavating Inc $704,976.00

Fox Contractors $1,100,004.00
Midwest Trenchless Services, LLC $956,400.00
Pinpoint Directional Drilling Inc NO BID

S&S Directional Boring, Ltd. $895,900.00
Engineer’s Estimate $709,100.00
#83860, Sunny Meadows (eBidDoc# 9602521)
bid date/time: 4/24/2025 2:00 PM
owner: CU — A Novak
NAME BID AMOUNT
Bercot Inc $668,630.00

Bunn Excavating, Inc NO BID

Exterior Service $386,117.00

Krafft Water Solutions, LLC. NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $955,245.00
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#112-3-25-25-3, Elevator History Center
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9614379)
4/24/2025 2:00 PM

owner: PM —Barry M
NAME BID AMOUNT
American Elevator Inc $176,637.00
Elevator Service Indiana NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $100,000.00
#112-3-25-25-4, Elevator Science Central (eBidDoc# 9614380)
bid date/time: 4/24/2025 2:00 PM
owner: PM —Barry M
NAME BID AMOUNT
American Elevator Inc $130,647.00
Elevator Service Indiana NO BID

Engineer’s Estimate $100,000.00

#112-3-25-25-5, Elevator Citizens Square
bid date/time:

(eBidDoc# 9614381)
4/24/2025 2:00 PM

owner: PM —Barry M
NAME BID AMOUNT
American Elevator Inc $130,117.00
Elevator Service Indiana NO BID
Engineer’s Estimate $100,000.00

bid date/time:

#Q 9610159, RFP 2025 Waterworks On-call

(eBidDoc# 9610159)
4/24/2025 2:00 PM

owner: CU — A Smedberg
NAME BID AMOUNT

All Seasons Underground Construction $20,220.00
Environmental Construction NO BID

Fox Contractors $31,041.00
Midwest Trenchless Services $28,880.00
Pinpoint Directional Drilling $32,970.00

S&S Directional Boring $34,883.00
Underground Contractors $31,175.00
Engineer’s Estimate $34,140.00

Adjourn Time: _2: 15 pm
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Call ToOrder 4 :00 pm

#Q 9612305, RFQ CU 2025-01 Prof & Tech Services (eBidDoc# 9612305)

bid date/time:

4/24/2025 4:00 PM

owner: CU-QPope
NAME Docs Rec’d
A&Z Engineering, LLC Rec’d
Abonmarche Consulting

American Structurepoint Rec’d
ARCO/Murray

Arcadis Rec’'d
Apex Consulting Rec’d
Black & Veatch Rec’d
Christopher B Burke Rec’d
DLZ Indiana, LLC Rec’'d
Donohue & Associates, Inc. Rec’'d
Electric Power Systems International - Indiana
ENGINEER & ENVIROMENTAL SOLUTIONS

Entrust Solutions Rec’d
Fleis & Vandenbrink Rec’d
GAl Rec’d
GRW

Jacobs Fort Wayne Rec’d
Jones & Henry Engineers, Ltd. Rec’d
JPR - Fort Wayne

Kimley-Horn & Assoc. Rec’d
Lochmueller Group

Metric Environmental LLC

OHM Advisors

Phoenix Consulting, LLC Rec’'d
POWER-tek USA LLC

SEH - Munster, IN

Seven Outsource

Short Elliott Hendrickson Rec’d
Thomas Swift

TRC Engineers, Inc

Valdes Engineering Company Rec’'d
Wessler Engineering Rec’'d
Woodruff Contracting and Sales
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